

COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services

212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503

Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493

Phone (803) 785-8166

Fax (803) 785-2240

STATEMENT OF AWARD

SOLICITATION NUMBER: *C15010-10/22/14S*

PROJECT TITLE: *Work Uniforms – Term Contract*

AWARDED TO: *Designlab, Inc.*

AMOUNT OF AWARD: *\$22,029.77*

DATE OF AWARD: *November 4, 2014*

Thank you for your interest in doing business with Lexington County.

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer

Posted: *November 5, 2014*

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

BID # : C15010-10/22/14S
Work Uniforms - Term Contract

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Lesesne Industries		Designlab, Inc.		Unifirst	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	300	EA	PANTS, Industrial, Mens	\$ 13.00	\$ 3,900.00	\$ 17.14	\$ 5,142.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 5,400.00
2	30	EA	PANTS, Industrial, Mens Relaxed Fit	\$ 13.00	\$ 390.00	\$ 14.54	\$ 436.20	\$ 18.00	\$ 540.00
3	15	EA	SHORTS, Industrial, Mens	\$ 10.93	\$ 163.95	\$ 13.09	\$ 196.35	\$ 16.00	\$ 240.00
4	64	EA	COVERALLS, Action-back, Lightweight	\$ 48.00	\$ 3,072.00	\$ 42.64	\$ 2,728.96		No Bid
5	64	EA	COVERALLS, Insulated, Heavy-duty	\$ 160.00	\$ 10,240.00	\$ 92.54	\$ 5,922.56		No Bid
6	245	EA	SHIRT, Poplin, Industrial, Mens Long Sleeve	\$ 9.25	\$ 2,266.25	\$ 11.49	\$ 2,815.05	\$ 16.00	\$ 3,920.00
7	245	EA	SHIRT, Poplin, Industrial, Mens Short Sleeve	\$ 8.10	\$ 1,984.50	\$ 10.34	\$ 2,533.30	\$ 15.00	\$ 3,675.00
8	25	EA	SHIRT, Stripes, Industrial, Mens Long Sleeve	\$ 12.40	\$ 310.00	\$ 14.09	\$ 352.25	\$ 19.00	\$ 475.00
9	25	EA	SHIRT, Stripes, Industrial, Mens Short Sleeve	\$ 10.65	\$ 266.25	\$ 12.34	\$ 308.50	\$ 18.00	\$ 450.00
10	10	EA	SHIRT, Jersey Knit, Mens Short Sleeve	\$ 11.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 15.34	\$ 153.40	\$ 15.00	\$ 150.00
11	117	EA	JACKET w/liner, Panel-front, Light Weight	\$ 26.75	\$ 3,129.75	\$ 33.14	\$ 3,877.38	\$ 35.00	\$ 4,095.00
12	70	EA	JACKET hooded, Duck, Insulated	\$ 47.25	\$ 3,307.50	\$ 48.24	\$ 3,376.80	\$ 45.00	\$ 3,150.00
13	50	EA	PANTS, Industrial, Womens Half-Elastic Waist	\$ 15.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 16.99	\$ 849.50	\$ 20.00	\$ 1,000.00
14	30	EA	SHIRT, Poplin, Industrial, Womens Long Sleeve	\$ 11.19	\$ 335.70	\$ 12.89	\$ 386.70	\$ 16.00	\$ 480.00
15	30	EA	SHIRT, Poplin, Industrial, Womens Short Sleeve	\$ 9.25	\$ 277.50	\$ 11.19	\$ 335.70	\$ 15.00	\$ 450.00
16	25	EA	SMOCK, Loose, 3/4 Length Sleeve	\$ 13.10	\$ 327.50	\$ 14.79	\$ 369.75	\$ 19.00	\$ 475.00
17	15	EA	SMOCK, Loose, 1/2 Length Sleeve	\$ 11.45	\$ 171.75	\$ 13.14	\$ 197.10	\$ 18.00	\$ 270.00
18	13	EA	PARKA, Men's Heavyweight	\$ 101.00	\$ 1,313.00	\$ 96.99	\$ 1,260.87		No Bid
19	70	EA	HOODED JACKET	\$ 65.00	\$ 4,550.00	\$ 63.79	\$ 4,465.30		No Bid
20	15	EA	PANTS, Industrial, Mens	\$ 19.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 19.24	\$ 288.60	\$ 23.00	\$ 345.00
21	50	EA	BELT	\$ 13.50	\$ 675.00	\$ 13.54	\$ 677.00	\$ 14.00	\$ 700.00
22	500	EA	EMBLEM, Name/Logo, Embroidered	\$ 1.50	\$ 750.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 2,500.00
23	500	EA	County Patch	\$ 1.75	\$ 875.00	\$ 1.50	\$ 750.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 1,500.00
23	1	LOT	Name Emboridered	\$ 2.50	\$ 2.50	\$ 4.00	\$ 4.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 3.00
24	1	LOT	Catalog Discount	0%	0%	20%	20%	20%	20%
			Subtotal		\$ 22,592.95		\$ 20,588.57		\$ 14,850.00
			Taxes		\$ 1,581.51		\$ 1,441.20		\$ 1,039.50
			Total		\$ 24,174.46		\$ 22,029.77		\$ 15,889.50

****Service Wear Apparel is deemed non response due to they qualified terms in the response to the bid and did not provide the proper forms.**

Bids Received: October 22, 2014 @ 3:00 PM E.S.T.

Angela M. Seymour
 Procurement Officer