
COUNTY OF LEXINGTON   

Procurement Services  

212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor 

Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493 

 
Phone (803) 785-8319 

Fax (803) 785-2240 

 

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE 

OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL 

APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED. 

 

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER:  C14022-02/13/14S 

 

PROCUREMENT: Signs and Sign Materials – Term Contract 

 

ISSUE DATE:      January 16, 2014 

 

CLOSING DATE:     February 13, 2014 

 

 

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING: 

 

Osborne Associates, Inc. 

$15,717.77 

 

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract 

shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of 

Intent to Award notice.  Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing 

where the County failed in determining the potential award. 

 

 

Angela M. Seymour 

Procurement Officer 

 

Posted:  February 28, 2014 

 

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 

 

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. 

 



BID # : C14022-02/13/14S

Signs and Sign Materials - Term Contract

Item Qty U/M Description  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost 

Signs 

1 100 EA

BLANK, Sign, Extruded, 6" x 

24", White HIP 3M 3930  $             19.00  $            1,900.00  $             16.50  $        1,650.00  $             11.52  $        1,152.00  $               6.73  $           673.00 

2 100 EA

BLANK, Sign, Extruded, 6" x 

30", White HIP 3M 3930  $             24.00  $            2,400.00  $             17.75  $        1,775.00  $             13.23  $        1,323.00  $               8.41  $           841.00 

3 100 EA

BLANK, Sign, Extruded, 6" x 

36", White HIP 3M 3930  $             28.00  $            2,800.00  $             19.10  $        1,910.00  $             14.94  $        1,494.00  $             10.10  $        1,010.00 

4 200 EA

COMPLETE, Sign, Stop R1 - 

30 x 30, Diamond Grade, 

Reflective Sheeting  $             82.00  $          16,400.00  $             72.95  $      14,590.00  $             49.64  $        9,928.00  $             35.45  $        7,090.00 

5 50 EA

BLANK, 30 x 30 Flat 

Aluminum std. radius covered 

with yellow 3M HIP 3931  $             84.00  $            4,200.00  $             15.95  $           797.50  $             28.50  $        1,425.00  $             26.13  $        1,306.50 

6 50 EA

BLANK, 18 x 18 Flat 

Aluminum std. radius covered 

with yellow 3M HIP 3931 (1 

side) with black border only  $             31.00  $            1,550.00  $             11.75  $           587.50  $             16.45  $           822.50  $               9.41  $           470.50 

7 25 EA

COMPLETE, Sign Speed 

Limit, R2-1, 24 x 30, Diamond 

Grade  $             76.00  $            1,900.00  $             73.25  $        1,831.25  $             39.48  $           987.00  $             29.50  $           737.50 

Subtotal  $          31,150.00  $      23,141.25  $      17,131.50  $      12,128.50 

Taxes  $            2,180.50  $        1,619.89  $        1,199.21  $           849.00 

Total  $          33,330.50  $      24,761.14  $      18,330.71  $      12,977.50 

Sign Post

8 100 EA

POST, U-Channel, Post 

Green 10 Foot  $             30.00  $            3,000.00  $             20.00  $        2,000.00  $             19.60  $        1,960.00  $             12.61  $        1,261.00 

Taxes  $               210.00  $           140.00  $           137.20  $             88.27 

Total  $            3,210.00  $        2,140.00  $        2,097.20  $        1,349.27 

Sign Brackets and Mounting Hardware

9 N/A N/A

Item Deleted with Amendment 

One  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A 

10 100 EA

CAPS, Sign, Mounting “Supr-

Lok” #922X  $               8.00  $               800.00  $               5.75  $           575.00  $               4.50  $           450.00  $               3.25  $           325.00 

11 100 EA

CROSS, Sign, Mounting “Supr-

Lok” #990X  $               7.50  $               750.00  $               5.49  $           549.00  $               4.50  $           450.00  $               3.25  $           325.00 

12 100 EA CAPS, “Supr-Lok”  91 UX 180  $               7.00  $               700.00  $               5.25  $           525.00  $               4.50  $           450.00  $               3.25  $           325.00 

13 100 EA

CAPS, “Supr-Lok” 91 UX OL 

90  $               7.00  $               700.00  $               5.20  $           520.00  $               4.50  $           450.00  $               3.25  $           325.00 

Subtotal  $            2,950.00  $        2,169.00  $        1,800.00  $        1,300.00 

Taxes  $               206.50  $           151.83  $           126.00  $             91.00 

Total  $            3,156.50  $        2,320.83  $        1,926.00  $        1,391.00 

Grand Total  $          39,697.00  $      29,221.97  $      22,353.91  $      15,717.77 

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

 The Brossard Group  Protective Services, Inc.  IBIS Signs  Osburn Associates, Inc. 



Item Qty U/M Description  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost 

Signs 

1 100 EA

BLANK, Sign, Extruded, 6" x 

24", White HIP 3M 3930  $               7.60  $               760.00  $             10.60  $        1,060.00  $               7.69  $           769.00  $             10.68  $        1,068.00 

2 100 EA

BLANK, Sign, Extruded, 6" x 

30", White HIP 3M 3930  $               9.50  $               950.00  $             12.75  $        1,275.00  $               9.62  $           962.00  $             13.35  $        1,335.00 

3 100 EA

BLANK, Sign, Extruded, 6" x 

36", White HIP 3M 3930  $             11.40  $            1,140.00  $             14.95  $        1,495.00  $             11.48  $        1,148.00  $             16.02  $        1,602.00 

4 200 EA

COMPLETE, Sign, Stop R1 - 

30 x 30, Diamond Grade, 

Reflective Sheeting  $             34.87  $            6,974.00  No Bid  $             33.15  $        6,630.00  $             48.50  $        9,700.00 

5 50 EA

BLANK, 30 x 30 Flat 

Aluminum std. radius covered 

with yellow 3M HIP 3931  $             23.87  $            1,193.50  No Bid  $             22.78  $        1,139.00  $             28.40  $        1,420.00 

6 50 EA

BLANK, 18 x 18 Flat 

Aluminum std. radius covered 

with yellow 3M HIP 3931 (1 

side) with black border only  $               8.59  $               429.50  No Bid  $               8.67  $           433.50  $             10.23  $           511.50 

7 25 EA

COMPLETE, Sign Speed 

Limit, R2-1, 24 x 30, Diamond 

Grade  $             28.65  $               716.25  No Bid  $             27.13  $           678.25  $             38.90  $           972.50 

Subtotal  $          12,163.25  $        3,830.00  $      11,759.75  $      16,609.00 

Taxes  $               851.43  $           268.10  $           823.18  $        1,162.63 

Total  $          13,014.68  $        4,098.10  $      12,582.93  $      17,771.63 

Sign Post

8 100 EA

POST, U-Channel, Post 

Green 10 Foot  $             14.70  $            1,470.00  $             14.16  $        1,416.00  $             15.97  $        1,597.00  $             14.44  $        1,444.00 

Taxes  $               102.90  $             99.12  $           111.79  $           101.08 

Total  $            1,572.90  $        1,515.12  $        1,708.79  $        1,545.08 

Sign Brackets and Mounting Hardware

9 N/A N/A

Item Deleted with Amendment 

One  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A 

10 100 EA

CAPS, Sign, Mounting “Supr-

Lok” #922X  $               3.30  $               330.00  $               2.95  $           295.00  $               3.83  $           383.00  $               2.98  $           298.00 

11 100 EA

CROSS, Sign, Mounting “Supr-

Lok” #990X  $               3.30  $               330.00  $               2.95  $           295.00  $               3.58  $           358.00  $               3.15  $           315.00 

12 100 EA CAPS, “Supr-Lok”  91 UX 180  $               3.30  $               330.00  $               2.95  $           295.00  $               2.96  $           296.00  $               2.98  $           298.00 

13 100 EA

CAPS, “Supr-Lok” 91 UX OL 

90  $               3.30  $               330.00  $               2.95  $           295.00  $               2.96  $           296.00  $               2.98  $           298.00 

Subtotal  $            1,320.00  $        1,180.00  $        1,333.00  $        1,209.00 

Taxes  $                 92.40  $             82.60  $             93.31  $             84.63 

Total  $            1,412.40  $        1,262.60  $        1,426.31  $        1,293.63 

Grand Total  $          15,999.98  $        6,875.82  $      15,718.03  $      20,610.34 

 Custom Products Corporation  MOSolutions  Vulcan Signs 

 Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, 

LLC. 



Item Qty U/M Description  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost 

Signs 

1 100 EA

BLANK, Sign, Extruded, 6" x 

24", White HIP 3M 3930  $               8.47  $               847.00  $               8.34  $           834.00  $               9.57  $           957.00  $             14.95  $        1,495.00 

2 100 EA

BLANK, Sign, Extruded, 6" x 

30", White HIP 3M 3930  $             10.99  $            1,099.00  $             10.42  $        1,042.00  $             11.99  $        1,199.00  $             18.70  $        1,870.00 

3 100 EA

BLANK, Sign, Extruded, 6" x 

36", White HIP 3M 3930  $             11.89  $            1,189.00  $             12.51  $        1,251.00  $             14.39  $        1,439.00  $             23.90  $        2,390.00 

4 200 EA

COMPLETE, Sign, Stop R1 - 

30 x 30, Diamond Grade, 

Reflective Sheeting  $             29.64  $            5,928.00  $             34.79  $        6,958.00  $             36.44  $        7,288.00  $             35.90  $        7,180.00 

5 50 EA

BLANK, 30 x 30 Flat 

Aluminum std. radius covered 

with yellow 3M HIP 3931  $             29.36  $            1,468.00  $             26.51  $        1,325.50  $             29.81  $        1,490.50  $             23.45  $        1,172.50 

6 50 EA

BLANK, 18 x 18 Flat 

Aluminum std. radius covered 

with yellow 3M HIP 3931 (1 

side) with black border only  $             12.30  $               615.00  $               9.54  $           477.00  $             10.02  $           501.00  $               8.45  $           422.50 

7 25 EA

COMPLETE, Sign Speed 

Limit, R2-1, 24 x 30, Diamond 

Grade  $             24.53  $               613.25  $             28.59  $           714.75  $             29.37  $           734.25  $             29.50  $           737.50 

Subtotal  $          11,759.25  $      12,602.25  $      13,608.75  $      15,267.50 

Taxes  $               823.15  $           882.16  $           952.61  $        1,068.73 

Total  $          12,582.40  $      13,484.41  $      14,561.36  $      16,336.23 

Sign Post

8 100 EA

POST, U-Channel, Post 

Green 10 Foot  $             18.18  $            1,818.00  $             18.42  $        1,842.00  No Bid  $             14.80  $        1,480.00 

Taxes  $               127.26  $           128.94  No Bid  $           103.60 

Total  $            1,945.26  $        1,970.94  No Bid  $        1,583.60 

Sign Brackets and Mounting Hardware

9 N/A N/A

Item Deleted with Amendment 

One  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A 

10 100 EA

CAPS, Sign, Mounting “Supr-

Lok” #922X  $               3.50  $               350.00  $               3.64  $           364.00  No Bid  $               4.75  $           475.00 

11 100 EA

CROSS, Sign, Mounting “Supr-

Lok” #990X  $               3.41  $               341.00  $               3.64  $           364.00  No Bid  $               4.15  $           415.00 

12 100 EA CAPS, “Supr-Lok”  91 UX 180  $               2.95  $               295.00  $               3.16  $           316.00  No Bid  $               3.55  $           355.00 

13 100 EA

CAPS, “Supr-Lok” 91 UX OL 

90  $               2.83  $               283.00  $               3.16  $           316.00  No Bid  $               3.50  $           350.00 

Subtotal  $            1,269.00  $        1,360.00  No Bid  $        1,595.00 

Taxes  $                 88.83  $             95.20  No Bid  $           111.65 

Total  $            1,357.83  $        1,455.20  No Bid  $        1,706.65 

Grand Total  $          15,885.49  $      16,910.55  No Bid  $      19,626.48 

 B. C. Cannon Company, Inc. 

 Garden State Highway 

Products, Inc.  Rocal, Inc.  Universal Signs & Accessories 



Item Qty U/M Description  Unit Total  Total Cost  Unit Total  Total Cost 

Signs 

1 100 EA

BLANK, Sign, Extruded, 6" x 

24", White HIP 3M 3930  No Bid  $             13.25  $        1,325.00 

2 100 EA

BLANK, Sign, Extruded, 6" x 

30", White HIP 3M 3930  No Bid  $             16.50  $        1,650.00 

3 100 EA

BLANK, Sign, Extruded, 6" x 

36", White HIP 3M 3930  No Bid  $             19.75  $        1,975.00 

4 200 EA

COMPLETE, Sign, Stop R1 - 

30 x 30, Diamond Grade, 

Reflective Sheeting  $             67.88  $          13,576.00  $             75.00  $      15,000.00 

5 50 EA

BLANK, 30 x 30 Flat 

Aluminum std. radius covered 

with yellow 3M HIP 3931  $             36.96  $            1,848.00  $             50.00  $        2,500.00 

6 50 EA

BLANK, 18 x 18 Flat 

Aluminum std. radius covered 

with yellow 3M HIP 3931 (1 

side) with black border only  $             13.74  $               687.00  $             27.75  $        1,387.50 

7 25 EA

COMPLETE, Sign Speed 

Limit, R2-1, 24 x 30, Diamond 

Grade  $             58.97  $            1,474.25  $             75.00  $        1,875.00 

Subtotal  $          17,585.25  $      25,712.50 

Taxes  $            1,230.97  $        1,799.88 

Total  $          18,816.22  $      27,512.38 

Sign Post

8 100 EA

POST, U-Channel, Post 

Green 10 Foot  No Bid  $             25.50  $        2,550.00 

Taxes  No Bid  $           178.50 

Total  No Bid  $        2,728.50 

Sign Brackets and Mounting Hardware

9 N/A N/A

Item Deleted with Amendment 

One  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A 

10 100 EA

CAPS, Sign, Mounting “Supr-

Lok” #922X  No Bid  $               4.50  $           450.00 

11 100 EA

CROSS, Sign, Mounting “Supr-

Lok” #990X  No Bid  $               4.95  $           495.00 

12 100 EA CAPS, “Supr-Lok”  91 UX 180  No Bid  $               4.95  $           495.00 

13 100 EA

CAPS, “Supr-Lok” 91 UX OL 

90  No Bid  $               4.95  $           495.00 

Subtotal  No Bid  $        1,935.00 

Taxes  No Bid  $           135.45 

Total  No Bid  $        2,070.45 

Grand Total  No Bid  $      32,311.33 

Bids Received: February 13, 2014 @ 3:00 PM E.S.T.

Angela M. Seymour

Procurement Officer

 Electromark  Carolina Custom Sign 


