
COUNTY OF LEXINGTON   

Procurement Services  

212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor 

Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493 

 
Phone (803) 785-8319 

Fax (803) 785-2240 

 

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE 

OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL 

APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED. 

 

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER:  B14006-10/24/13S 

 

PROCUREMENT: WEAPONS PURCHASE AND DISPOSAL 

OF USED AND CONFISCATED 

FIREARMS 

 

ISSUE DATE:      September 26, 2013 

 

CLOSING DATE:     October 24, 2013 

 

 

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING: 

 

Lot #1:  No Award 

 

Lot #2  Lawmen’s Safety Supply, Inc. 

 

Lot #3  Phoenix Distributors, Inc. 

 

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract 

shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of 

Intent to Award notice.  Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing 

where the County failed in determining the potential award. 

 

 

Angela M. Seymour 

Procurement Officer 

 

Posted:  November 13, 2013 

 

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 

 

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. 

 



BID: B14006-10/24/13S

Weapons Purchase and Disposal of Used and Confiscated Firearms

Lot #1

Item Qty U/M Description  Unit Price  Total Price  Unit Price  Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price  Total Price 

1 220 ea

Safariland Model 7360 holsters in in plain black 

STX finish to fit GLOCK Model 17 – Right hand  No Award  No Award  No Award  No Award 

2 30 ea

Safariland Model 7360 holsters in in plain black 

STX finish to fit GLOCK Model 17 – Lef hand  No Award  No Award  No Award  No Award 

3 5 ea
Safariland Model 6006-1-21 ALS Guard Left hand 

 No Award  No Award  No Award  No Award 

4 50 ea

Safariland Model 6006-1-21 ALS Guard Right 

hand (Vendor Offer XX)  No Award  No Award  No Award  No Award 

Subtotal  No Award  No Award  No Award  No Award 

Tax  No Award  No Award  No Award  No Award 

Total  No Award  No Award  No Award  No Award 

Lot #2

1 220 ea

Safariland Model 7360 holsters in in plain black 

STX finish to fit GLOCK Model 17 – Right hand  $        65.85  $ 14,487.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 30 ea

Safariland Model 7360 holsters in in plain black 

STX finish to fit GLOCK Model 17 – Lef hand  $        65.85  $   1,975.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 40 ea

Safariland Model 6006-1-21 ALS Guard Left hand 

(Vendor Offer XX)  $          7.11  $      284.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 30 ea

Safariland Model 6006-1-21 ALS Guard Right 

hand (Vendor Offer XX)  $          7.11  $      213.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Subtotal  $ 16,960.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tax  $   1,187.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total  $ 18,147.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Lot #3

1 1 lot

Offer To Purchase Used Service And Confiscated 

Firearms  $25,905.00  $25,905.00 31,375.00$  31,375.00$  28,620.00$  $28,620.00 21,854.00$  21,854.00$   

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

 OMB Guns 

 Craig's Firearm Supply, 

Inc.  Phoenix Distributors 

 Lawemen's Safety 

Supply, Inc. 



Lot #1

Item Qty U/M Description  Unit Price  Total Price Unit Price  Total Price  Unit Price  Total Price 

1 220 ea

Safariland Model 7360 holsters in in plain black 

STX finish to fit GLOCK Model 17 – Right hand  No Award  No Award  No Award 

2 30 ea

Safariland Model 7360 holsters in in plain black 

STX finish to fit GLOCK Model 17 – Lef hand  No Award  No Award  No Award 

3 5 ea
Safariland Model 6006-1-21 ALS Guard Left hand 

 No Award  No Award  No Award 

4 1 ea

Safariland Model 6006-1-21 ALS Guard Right 

hand (Vendor Offer XX)  No Award  No Award  No Award 

Subtotal  No Award  No Award  No Award 

Tax  No Award  No Award  No Award 

Total  No Award  No Award  No Award 

Lot #2

1 220 ea

Safariland Model 7360 holsters in in plain black 

STX finish to fit GLOCK Model 17 – Right hand No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 30 ea

Safariland Model 7360 holsters in in plain black 

STX finish to fit GLOCK Model 17 – Lef hand No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 1 ea

Safariland Model 6006-1-21 ALS Guard Left hand 

(Vendor Offer XX) No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 1 ea

Safariland Model 6006-1-21 ALS Guard Right 

hand (Vendor Offer XX) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Subtotal No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tax No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total No Bid No Bid No Bid

Lot #3

1 1 lot

Offer To Purchase Used Service And Confiscated 

Firearms  $19,375.00  $19,375.00 15,200.00$  15,200.00$  14,127.00$  14,127.00$  

Bids opened October 24, 2013 @ 3:00 PM E.S.T.

Angela M. Seymour

Procurement Officer

 Dana Safety Supply  144 Firearms 

 Kings Firearms and More, 

LLC. 

 Kings Firearms and More, 

LLC. 




